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Duty of Care and a Competent Person
- A Regulatory Perspective
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Introduction

The fundamental precept of the Occupational Safety and Health Legislation in Western
Australia, in common with that in many other jurisdictions, is the general duty of care which
is laid on all persons involved in the industry, and upon all employers of persons, whether a
natural person or a body corporate.

In basic terms, the duty of care for the individual is to take reasonable care to ensure his or
her own safety and health at work and to avoid adversely affecting others through any act or
omission, and also to comply with instructions and obligations on work procedures, to use
protective equipment when required, and to report hazards and potentially serious
occurrences.

These duties are attached to every person employed at a mining operation, from the Chief
Executive Officer, to the miner at the face. A broader range of obligations is laid on the

employer.

Persons who are appointed to positions of control and authority, by the employer, (which is
normally a body corporate and rarely, in mining, a natural person), have additional
obligations placed on them on behalf of the employer to carry out specified functions, over
and above their individual personal duty of care. Such appointments may be corporate in
nature, and some are statutory appointments made in accordance with the legislation.

In this paper, the implications of competence of persons are considered, in the context of the
mining safety legislation in WA, (Mines Safety and Inspection Act 1994), in respect of both
individuals in a range of capacities, and the corporation as an employer. The corporation’s
will and directions are necessarily given effect through persons employed by it to do so. It is
manifest that in order for it to comply with these very broad obligations, as well as those
which are more specific, all persons must be competent to perform their assigned duties.
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The term “competent” in this context means having the capability, capacity or proficiency to
carry out required tasks or functions. In its current usage “competency based training”
means that a process of verification by assessment has been carried out to ensure that the
individual is actually competent to perform the tasks and functions concerned. It is not
sufficient to assume competence on the basis of a course of instruction or learning without
that verification by assessment. The actual assessment is carried out by persons qualified for
the purpose, to established competency standards.

The term “competent person” is defined in the Mines Safety and Inspection Act;

“competent person means a person who is appointed or designated by the employer fo
perform specified duties which the person is qualified to perform by knowledge, training and
experience.”

This term is used in particular where there are specified duties to be carried out by the
employer, and it is necessary for the employer to assign responsibility for carrying out those
duties on its behalf to an appropriate competent person.

In no case does this provision for persons to carry out specified functions imply that
competency is required only of such nominated persons and only for those functions. It is

required of all for safe performance.

Development and Verification of Competence

A key component of the duty of care obligations on the employer is to

“provide such information, training and supervision of employees as is necessary to enable
them to perform their work in such a manner that they are not exposed to hazards”.

In order to comply with this obligation it is necessary to ensure that all employees (at
whatever level of control and responsibility) are competent to perform assigned tasks and
functions. Implicit in this is the capacity to determine when changed or unanticipated
circumstances lead to a situation which is beyond the competence of the person concerned to
deal with. The preferred and safe course is to report or refer the situation, and not take an
unacceptable risk in going beyond individual capacity.

Induction and Training of New Employees

The achievement of competence is a structured, incremental and ongoing process, involving
training to provide underpinning knowledge, and development of skills and capacities,
verified by valid processes of assessment.

The induction of new employees to a mining operation is a critical start to the process of
development of the essential competencies.

An effective induction involves equipping the new employee with the necessary basic
competencies to enter the mining work environment. Validation of acquisition of these
competencies is an essential part of the induction process. Assurance of the validity of the
induction is managed by maintaining the competencies of the providers, and the quality of
the resource materials used, at a high standard.
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The matters normally covered in a general induction include the essentials of the safety
legislation, procedures for safe working, an understanding of the working environment, and
emergency procedures.

If the process is not managed effectively to develop the necessary base level competencies,
but simply delivered in a desultory manner, and without validation by assessment, the
potential for detriment to safe performance in the workplace is high. The capacity of the
individual may be taken for granted simply because an induction process has been carried
out, without verification, by persons lacking the competency to do so.

Ongoing Training and Development, Directed at Achievement of Competency

The Mines Safety and Inspection Regulations 1995 support the obligation in the duty of care
in the Act by requiring that each employee is:

(@)  given adequate instruction and training in safety procedures and systems of work
and in the tasks required of the employee;

(b)  assessed before commencing work at the mine to ensure that the employee is
competent to perform the tasks he or she will be assigned and to operate any plant
and equipment the employee will be required to operate; and

(c)  retrained and reassessed whenever systems of work or plant and equipment are
changed, or new systems of work or plant and equipment are introduced.

It is important to note that these provisions relevantly include a requirement for agsessment
to ensure competency and require retraining and reassessment as systems and tasks change.
Recording of training, retraining and assessment is also required.

This requirement for competency of persons is reiterated through the regulations, so that it is
manifestly a required condition.

Some illustrative examples of specified requirements for competent persons include:-

- Checking of fall-arrest equipment

- Construction work

- High voltage operators

- Installation and maintenance of plant, assessment of damage, and testing after repair
- Dismantling disposal and storage of plant

- Persons carrying out electrical work on plant

- Operators and drivers of plant and equipment

- Users of explosives to be competent; (an appointed person verifies the competency)
- Dealing with misfires in blasting, and with specialist blasting procedures

- Competency of hoist drivers, skipmen and platman in shafts

- Railway operators (major Pilbara iron ore rail systems)

- Ventilation Officers; (competency to be specified)

Specified Management Appointments and Competencies

The Act contains provisions for particular appointments of persons to carry out specified
functions on behalf of the principal employer, with the objective of maintaining that
employer’s compliance with the Act, in ensuring the safety of employees.
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The key appointment is that of registered manager, who is responsible on a daily basis for
the control and supervision of the mine, and mining operations at the mine, in accordance
with the Act. This is a statutory position, but does not require certification.

The Act requires that the registered manager must appoint, or ensure the appointment of,
such competent persons as are necessary to assist the registered manager to carry out his or
her duties under the Act.

A number of these appointments will be of a general corporate nature as required by the
enterprise, but some are specified in the Act and the persons appointed to these positions are
required to hold certificates of competency.

A certificated underground manager and supervisors are required when underground mining
operations are carried out.

Where quarry (or open cut/open pit) operations are carried out, a certificated quarry manager
is required, and also competent persons appointed to supervise.

Achievement of Certification requires:

- Professional or technical qualifications
- Substantial practical mining experience
- Examination in the mining law

The legislation is currently being amended to include a requirement for persons who are to
be appointed to these positions to have both certification, and verification of achievement of
the appropriate level of management and supervisory competencies.

The management competencies adopted are the nationally accredited Front Line Management
Initiative (FMI) competencies which were established following the KARPIN ® Report on
management and supervision across Australian Industry. This report identified deficiencies in

this area.

The need for development and verification of these competencies for managers and
supervisors has also been underlined in several inquiries into mining disasters in Australia,
and was a priority recommendation in the Report on the Inquiry into Fatalities in the
Western Australian Mining Industry released in 1998, @

The Act requires certification for managers and supervisors in particular for underground
and open pit operations, due to the nature of the working environment.

The workplace in these operations is constructed in a medium of considerably less than
reliable structural predictability, (rock in nature), and moreover is changed with each
successive blast.

The underground environment has additional hazards in that it is a confined environment in
which the atmosphere is readily vitiated during operations, and plant and equipment is
operated in confined spaces. Lighting of workplaces is difficult, and development of the
underground workings depends on precision in surveying. There is very little margin for
error and oversights by management and supervision.
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Consequently, as well as technical and professional skills and qualifications, substantial
practical experience and verified competency is necessary for persons to manage and
supervise these operations safely.

Conventional surface workplaces are generally inherently less hazardous than those in the
direct mining environment, and substantial reliance may be placed on codes and standards,
in terms of stability and structural reliability of constructed workplaces.

Verification of the FMI competencies will be a legal requirement only for those appointed to
certificated positions, but the Chamber of Minerals and Energy has obtained commitment
from its member companies to develop and assure these competencies throughout the
management and supervisory staff employed on mining operations, without any legislated
obligation to do so.

The fact that only these persons appointed to statutorily certificated positions are obliged by
legislation to provide verification of the FMI competencies does not imply that it is to any
degree less important that managers and supervisors of other operations at the mine have
those competencies.

The point is that in order to legislate for a general application beyond the two areas of
operational management which require certificated appointments, it would be necessary to
identify and specify a wide range of functions, which would be difficult to do with precision
across a diverse and complex industry. However the general duty of care obligations on the
employer to provide competent staff and appropriate supervision are a strong driver for
assurance of competency across the organisation.

It is also necessary, in this context, to recognise that other operating functions at mines,
particularly treatment and process plants, have a range of hazards in which high potential
risk spectrums have to be managed. Such plants may be characterised by functions requiring
large amounts of stored energy and substantial inventories of hazardous materials.

The problem is more acute in complex, tightly coupled systems where failures produce rapid
effects elsewhere in the system with little scope or capacity for recovery.

It is common experience that most plant problems arise during non-standard conditions such
as breakdown or even scheduled maintenance activities, and a high level of vigilance is
essential in relation to effects from sections of the plant not involved in the shutdown, but
operating in close proximity to the work being carried out.

The General Recognition of Competency Based Training

Throughout Australia over the past decade and more, there has been a widespread
recognition of the need for development of competency in the workforce in the interests of
both safety and efficiency. Across all major industry sectors, Industry Training Advisory
Boards have been set up at State and National level.

An important outcome of this process has been the establishment of nationally accredited
frameworks of competency standards upon which competency based training and
development of the required skills and capacities can be based.
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An extractive industry competency package has been developed in which persons can
progress through to Advanced Diploma Level in open pit mining and quarrying.

A broad based framework of competencies for metalliferous mining is well advanced, which
covers all aspects of the mining industry operations, mining, services, engineering, treatment
and processing etc.

As a consequence of both these developments and the overarching obligations for
competence of employees and supervisors contained in the duty of care legislation, the
legislated requirements for licensing, certification etc. of persons has been reduced to a
minimum. A range of nationally recognised competencies for particular high risk potential
categories of work (such as crane drivers, riggers, scaffolders etc.) is generally adopted as
standard by most if not all state jurisdictions.

In some jurisdictions, (including Western Australia) there is an authorised mine surveyor
appointment required under the Act.

The specification for competency for this particular function recognizes the high level of risk
resulting from failures in survey integrity, particularly in underground mines.

However in the great majority of activities at each mining operation the onus falls on the
employer to establish standards and verify competencies for the range of functions to be

carried out.

Competency Based Training for Miners in Western Australia

The recent Report on the Inquiry into Fatalities in the Western Australian Mining Industry,
gave impetus to the need for the development of verified competencies for underground
miners in particular,

Rapid turnover of personnel and shorter retention time of workers in the industry have made
an ongoing system of competency training for miners an imperative.

A taskforce established by the Chamber of Minerals and Energy, with input from the
Department of Minerals and Energy, has developed a program based on the National
Competency framework referred to earlier.

It is currently being run as a pilot program and feedback on results to date is expected to be
available at this MINESAFE 2000 Conference.

As well as providing verification and assurance to employers, miners will have documented
competency levels, providing portability of their capacities in Western Australia, and in
time, more widely.

The pitfalls of ad hoc training and assumption of capabilities without verification will
become a thing of the past when the program is fully established.
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Past Experience of Erosion of Competence in the Western Australian Mining
Industry, and the Implications for the Future

It is instructive to review briefly the experience of the industry during the past 15 to 20
years.

The decade of the eighties was characterised by a boom in mining generally in Western
Australia, and particularly in gold mining, with a resurgence of underground mining.

The limited pool of experienced and competent mining professionals, supervisors and miners
was rapidly diluted as the industry expanded.

Personnel were fast tracked into underground mining work without the benefit of a gradual
transition through the range of less demanding tasks which was the industry norm when the
pace of development and change was slower.

New graduates were prematurely thrust into supervisory positions, and persons lacking the
essential depth of experience and maturity in judgement were appointed as managers.

The adverse trend in safety performance in the underground gold mining sector triggered an
inquiry in 1990. The report from this inquiry underlined a range of problems and made
recommendations for remedial action, most of which were implemented in the subsequent
five to six years.

Similar problems were manifested in the surface mining sector, in terms of lack of
experience of operators, and rapid turnover of staff.

The widespread adoption of long distance commuting from the mid to late eighties and
through the current decade introduced a new dimension of difficulty, with cyclic changes of
crews and supervision and managers, and discontinuities at handover.

In terms of the need for improved safety performance, the older style command and control
system of supervision and management was slow to adapt to the consultative approach
which is built into the new legislation. In this process, involvement of the people actually
carrying out the work in framing systems of work and task procedures is established as
fundamental to efficient and safe performance.

During the current decade, industry expansion continued, and structuring of the work was
characterised by a move to contracting out the bulk of the mining development and
production functions, both surface and underground.

There has been a sustained reduction in technical and engineering staff employed by the
mining companies (principals) with this more general contracting out of the work.

Some dislocation and discontinuities in the management and control functions were also
manifested, particularly where several contractors and sub-contractors, together with top up
from labor hire firms, were involved.
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One consequence of this has been that young mining professionals are increasingly being
recruited by the mining contractors rather than the mining companies, which has impacted
on a structured career path development in those companies. A systematic process of
competency development has not been achievable for many.

Many operations are characterised by regular and sometimes rapid turnover of staff in the
management, and technical/professional ranks.

The general diminution of in-depth professional engineering expertise within mining
corporations has meant that more reliance will be placed on hiring consultants on a needs
basis, rather than maintaining in-house capacity. This requires a process of assurance of the
competency of consultants themselves, in the range of specialist services provided. The
professional institutes are actively promoting continuing professional development and
achievement and maintenance of chartered professional status.

This process of down sizing and out-sourcing and out-placing of a range of capacities has the
potential for detriment, not only in the loss of corporate memory, but in the erosion of the
aggregate competency base in essential disciplines in the mining corporations.

A clearly focused forward looking strategy is required of corporate and professional leaders
in the industry to ensure that mining not only remains viable in the next millenium, but also
maintains continuous improvement in safety and health performance, free from the catalogue
of death and injury, and periodic disasters which have marred the past century.

Delivery of Competency Development across the Industry — the Formula for
the Future

Critical to the success of programs of competency development is the capability of both
mining enterprises, and of the organisations providing training and assessment, to prepare
the required resource materials and provide sufficient competent training delivery and
assessment capacity to bring the industry workforce up to the required standards, and to
maintain the competencies at all levels across the industry.

Tertiary qualifications and well developed technician and certification skills are available
through the Universities and Colleges of Technical and further education. However
achievement of the capacities needed for full competence in the demanding range of
activities in this industry will continue to rely on active programs delivering graded and
structured experience throughout each enterprise. National standards assist in quality
assurance and portability of competencies.

The Chamber of Minerals and Energy, as the peak industry body for mining in Western
Australia, has appropriately taken a leading role in driving for development of competency
standards, and their implementation.

The Department of Minerals and Energy, as the regulatory authority, has fully supported
these initiatives as they are a major driver to assist mining companies to achieve compliance
with a critical aspect of the duty of care for employers.
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The contracting sector is now a major stakeholder in the industry, in Western Australia and
nationally, and has accepted the responsibility attached to this status in its involvement in the
establishment of competency based training. The pooling and free sharing of resources in
setting up the underground miner competency training program has been a very creditable
demonstration of the collective will and capacity for future improvement.

The industry must extend these initiatives and maintain the thrust for improvement in all
spheres of activity. An effective partnership between contractors, and mining corporations
as principals, is an imperative, in the drive for continuous improvement and achievement of

excellence in safe performance.

A critical consideration for the future is the increased construction and operation of major
plants in downstream processing.

These are growing rapidly in size and complexity, with high levels of stored energy sources,
and an extensive range of hazardous substances in use in the process, as was remarked on
earlier. Any failure may have catastrophic consequences if not effectively controlled.

The standard of risk management demanded is extremely high and a safety case approach
similar to that used in the petroleum production industry is required for these complex
operations.

Establishment and maintenance of the highest standards of competence in the operation of
these facilities will be a major challenge for the future.

Conclusion

There are three essential and fundamental conditions to be developed and maintained within
an organisation for safe performance:
KNOWLEDGE
CAPACITY
MOTIVATION

Competency is the key factor in the second of these.

In moving to assure the levels of competency required by the legislated duty of care, and the
more specifically identified obligations, the industry must ensure, by both collective effort
and by the exercise of due diligence at each and every enterprise, that the essential
competencies are recognised, developed, achieved and maintained.

The role of the regulator will be to assist in framing improving standards, and to monitor
performance, encourage, and where necessary and appropriate, apply corrective or remedial
measures to ensure performance meets or exceeds the legislated requirements.
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